
  

 
 

Diversity and Inclusion Statement 
 
 
At 6 Stones, we embody our values of Christ-centered, 
Compassionate, Integrity, Unified, Servant-hearted, and Influencer.  
 
We are servant-hearted influencers who lead the way by loving 
others without fail. As such, we commit to bringing unity and love 
through a workforce unified around Christ. This biblically-based love 
is not limited by race, religion, ethnicity, sexual orientation, or 
anything else that might look different to the world. On the contrary, 
we stand with integrity following the example of Jesus by loving, 
embracing, and caring for the needs of the hopeless among us in 
an effort to bring Hope.  
 
We are committed to looking more and more like the community we 
serve. Our staff and our board are growing more diverse and will 
continue to grow more and more reflective of the families who trust 
us for the resources this community has stewarded to us to meet 
needs. Not only will we represent the tribes, tongues, and nations 
that are representative of the Kingdom we serve, we will be 
influencers who ask questions and challenge that same growth 
throughout our community.  
 
We believe in Hope given freely to all. A free Hope is given 
equitably to access resources regardless of backgrounds and 
limiting factors. A Hope that believes that every person has a God-
given purpose that is supported by a Spirit that has already overcome 
every systemic challenge that could stand in its way.  
 
6 Stones' legacy represents community mobilization bringing Hope 
to every single person experiencing hopelessness among us. We 
are 6 Stones. We are a Catalyst of Hope.  


